
BID #: 24 Company Name

DEPARTMENT: Childhood Services Address

DATE: 8/25/2011 City, State, Zip

FOB-ASU FOB-ASU FOB-ASU FOB-ASU FOB-ASU FOB-ASU

NET NET 30 NET 10 NET 30 NET 30 1% 10 NET30

Item # QTY UOM Item Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 15 CS 12-16 Gal Trash Bags $31.60 $474.00 23.92* - Bid A $358.80 $28.79 $431.85 NO BID $0.00 $23.31 $349.65 $18.59 $278.85

2 30 CS 40-45 Gal Trash Bags $18.85 $565.50 23.82* - Bid A $714.40 $26.82 $804.60 NO BID $0.00 $24.34 $730.20 $13.09 $392.70

3 3 CS Jumbo Straws $22.43 $67.29 NO BID $0.00 $44.85 $134.55 $52.92 $158.76 $59.55 $178.65 NO BID $0.00

4 20 CS Facial Tissue $40.80 $816.00 NO BID $0.00 $79.90 $1,598.00 $54.78 $1,095.60 $75.50 $1,510.00 NO BID $0.00

5 20 CS Freezer Bags, 1 Gal $17.00 $340.00 NO BID $0.00 $28.16 $563.20 $32.55 $651.00 $30.44 $608.80 $20.13 $402.60

6 50 CS Foam Cup, 8 oz $16.05 $802.50 NO BID $0.00 $18.02 $901.00 $14.62 $731.00 $19.83 $991.50 NO BID $0.00

7 125 CS Towels, 9 x 9 $15.89 $1,986.25 NO BID $0.00 $21.19 $2,648.75 $19.49 $2,436.25 $19.98 $2,497.50 NO BID $0.00

8 35 CS Foam Plate, 6" $25.34 $886.90 NO BID $0.00 $25.22 $882.70 $15.00 $525.00 $26.88 $940.80 NO BID $0.00

9 60 CS Foam Plate, 8 7/8" $25.15 $1,509.00 NO BID $0.00 $22.25 $1,335.00 $24.23 $1,453.80 $33.06 $1,983.60 NO BID $0.00

10 12 CS Foam Bowl, 5 oz $22.85 $274.20 NO BID $0.00 $26.08 $312.96 $14.35 $172.20 $33.80 $405.60 NO BID $0.00

11 20 CS Liquid Bleach, 1 gal $12.30 $246.00 NO BID $0.00 $12.93 $258.60 $12.06 $241.20 $13.50 $270.00 NO BID $0.00

12 15 CS Toilet Tissue, 96rls/cs $33.12 $496.80 NO BID $0.00 $39.13 $586.95 $41.57 $623.55 $40.46 $606.90 NO BID $0.00

13 60 CS Spoons, 1000/cs $11.46 $687.60 NO BID $0.00 $13.98 $838.80 $22.87 $1,372.20 $11.77 $706.20 NO BID $0.00

14 20 CS Forks, 1000/cs $11.46 $229.20 NO BID $0.00 $13.98 $279.60 $16.60 $332.00 $11.77 $235.40 NO BID $0.00

15 20 CS Sanitizer, 32 oz $19.95 $399.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $72.42 $1,448.40 $30.60 $612.00 NO BID $0.00

16 6 CS Antibacterial Hand Soap, 1 gal $21.90 $131.40 NO BID $0.00 $37.96 $227.76 $43.08 $258.48 $49.96 $299.76 NO BID $0.00

17 12 CS Water cups, $38.58 $462.96 NO BID $0.00 $77.99 $935.88 $48.40 $580.80 $66.87 $802.44 NO BID $0.00

18 12 CS Spartan, 128 Fluid Oz $45.75 $549.00 NO BID $0.00 $59.99 $719.88 NO BID $0.00 $56.32 $675.84 NO BID $0.00

19 Escalation  -1st Yr; 2nd Yr 0 Percent 0 Percent 15 Percent 15 Percent 0-8 percent 0-12 Percent 5 Percent 5 Percent 5 Percent 10 Percent Left Blank Left Blank

TOTALS $10,923.60 Varies $13,460.08 $12,080.24 $14,404.84 $1,074.15

ACT 157 YES YES YES
YES YES YES

DISCLOSURE YES YES YES
YES YES YES

MINORITY NOT YES NOT
NOT NOT NOT

EO POLICY YES YES YES
YES YES YES

W-9 YES NO YES
YES YES YES

*FIVE BIDS FOR ITEM #1 & 2 - Bid A = Item #1 - $23.92, Item #2 - $23.82;  Bid B - Item #1 - $19.98, Item #2 - $19.82; Bid C - Item #1 - $13.84, Item #2 - $13.48; Bid D - Item #1 - $16.82, Item #2 $16.34; Bid E - Item #1 - $13.84, Item #2 - $12.82

Prices Secured and Awarded As Circles Above By:   _______________________________________________________________                        

                                                                                                  Carol Barnhill, C.P.M., Opened by: _ Rebecca Spicer___________________________________

                                                                                                  Director of Procurement & Travel Services Recorded by: __Lisa Glasco_________________________________

TERMS:

FOB:

Quill Corp

100 Schelter Rd

Lincolnshire, IL 60069-3621

Clean Solutions

232 CR 702

Jonesboro, AR 72401

ARKANSAS STATE UNIVERSITY-JONESBORO BID TABULATION

American Paper & Twine Co

11611 Otter Creek South Road

Mabelvale, AR 72103

Interboro Packaging Corp

114 Bracken Rd

Montgomery, NY 12549

Martin Industrial Supplies

916 E Lincoln 

Searcy, AR 72143

All American Poly

2 Perlman Dr Ste 306

Spring Valley, NY 10977


